

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway
Suite A
Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

February 6, 2014

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0002

Inv #: 9422

RE: Robert Burns v. LA Auctioneering Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Jan-07-14	Receipt and review notice from court of trial date; calendar bench trial; transmit to client; assign task to associate	0.50	75.00	LSB
	Receipt and review of judgment on various motions	0.20	30.00	LSB
Jan-08-14	Email from Sandy [REDACTED] email to Sandy	0.25	37.50	LSB
	Correspondence with LSB regarding case management.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Jan-21-14	Receipt and review of [REDACTED] from Edmonds	0.10	15.00	LSB
Jan-24-14	Receipt and review of email [REDACTED] forward to Sandy	0.20	30.00	LSB
	Email from Burns regarding witness list.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Totals	1.45	\$212.50	

DISBURSEMENTS

Jan-16-14 Postage - Notice of trial to 5 Board Members (\$0.46 x 5) 2.30

Invoice #: 9422

Page 2

February 6, 2014

Totals

\$2.30

Total Fee & Disbursements

\$214.80

Previous Balance

441.98

Previous Payments

441.98

Balance Now Due

\$214.80

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

Jan-16-14

For Services Rendered

441.98

Total Payments

\$441.98

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway

Suite A

Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

May 2, 2014

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0005

Inv #: 9628

RE: Robert Burns vs. LA Auctioneers Licensing Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Jan-13-14	Correspondence from Burns regarding oppositions.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Receipt and review of [REDACTED]	0.90	112.50	JHL
Jan-14-14	Phone call [REDACTED]	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Review of email [REDACTED]	0.10	12.50	JHL
Jan-30-14	Returned [REDACTED] phone call.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Phone call [REDACTED]	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Receipt and review of [REDACTED]	0.30	37.50	JHL
Jan-31-14	Email from [REDACTED]	0.10	12.50	JHL
Feb-03-14	Hearing on exceptions at 19th JDC.	3.00	375.00	JHL
Apr-08-14	Receipt and review of judgment on exceptions and special motion.	0.10	12.50	JHL

Invoice #: 9628

Page 2

May 2, 2014

	Email [REDACTED]	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Review of articles cited in ruling.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Apr-09-14	Receipt and review of revised draft judgment [REDACTED]	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Correspondence with Burns and Guilliot regarding judgment and costs.	0.20	25.00	JHL
	Receipt and review of judgment being filed by Guilliot.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Apr-10-14	Emails from Burns and Guilliot regarding judgment.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Apr-21-14	Receipt and review of signed Judgment	0.20	30.00	LSB
Apr-25-14	E-mail to Burns and client attaching letter to Judge	0.05	3.00	PL2
	Totals	5.85	\$733.00	

DISBURSEMENTS

Jan-31-14	Photocopies - 15 BW @ \$0.10 each	1.50	
Apr-30-14	Photocopies 2 BW @ .10	0.20	
	Totals	\$1.70	
	Total Fee & Disbursements		\$734.70
	Balance Now Due		\$734.70

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway

Suite A

Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

March 5, 2014

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0002

Inv #: 9519

RE: Robert Burns v. LA Auctioneering Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Feb-03-14	Preparation of materials [REDACTED]	0.30	37.50	JHL
Feb-04-14	Review of documents [REDACTED]	1.50	225.00	LSB
Feb-05-14	Preparation for deposition of Robert Burns	2.00	300.00	LSB
	Preparation of [REDACTED]	0.40	50.00	JHL
Feb-06-14	Preparation for and attend deposition of Robert Burns	3.00	450.00	LSB
	Discussed legal issues with LSB [REDACTED]	0.20	25.00	JHL
Feb-20-14	Supervise public records inspection by Robert Burns and Freddie Phillips - No Charge	2.25	0.00	PL2
Feb-25-14	Receipt and review of [REDACTED] email to client	0.25	37.50	LSB
Feb-28-14	Email from Burns; email to [REDACTED]	0.25	37.50	LSB
	Totals	10.15	\$1,162.50	

DISBURSEMENTS

Feb-24-14 Deposition Costs - Invoice No. #17693WK

843.55

Invoice #: 9519

Page 2

March 5, 2014

Mar-03-14 Photocopies - 116 BW @ \$0.10 each

11.60

Totals

\$855.15

Total Fee & Disbursements

\$2,017.65

Retainers Applied

112.50

Previous Balance

214.80

Previous Payments

214.80

Balance Now Due

\$1,905.15

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

Feb-13-14 For Services Rendered

327.30

Total Payments

\$327.30

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway
Suite A
Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

April 11, 2014

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

File #: 1107-0002
Inv #: 9591

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

RE: Robert Burns v. LA Auctioneering Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Mar-05-14	Receipt and review of email; review of transcript	0.25	37.50	LSB
	Review of transcripts and email to Robert Burns	0.40	60.00	LSB
Mar-06-14	Begin work on Pre-Trial Order; assign task to paralegal; email to Robert Burns	1.00	150.00	LSB
	Research [REDACTED]	4.50	270.00	PL2
	Research [REDACTED]	1.75	105.00	PL2
Mar-07-14	Research [REDACTED]	2.50	150.00	PL2
	Draft pre-trial inserts	4.00	240.00	PL2
Mar-10-14	Email to [REDACTED]	0.20	25.00	JHL
	Reviewed and revised pretrial inserts.	0.60	75.00	JHL
Mar-11-14	Review PTO	0.45	67.50	LSB

Invoice #: 9591

Page 2

April 11, 2014

Mar-12-14	Review of final document PTO; add exhibits	1.25	187.50	LSB
	Email from Burns regarding pretrial exhibits and witnesses.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Mar-13-14	Email from Burns regarding pretrial inserts.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Mar-14-14	Review of documents (exhibits) from Burns	0.40	60.00	LSB
Mar-17-14	Review draft joint pre-trial order submitted by plaintiff.	3.80	228.00	PL2
	Draft letter detailing deficiencies in draft joint pre-trial order submitted by plaintiff.	1.75	105.00	PL2
	Draft pre-trial order	2.00	120.00	PL2
Mar-19-14	Revise email to Robert Burns regarding Pre-Trial Order	0.40	60.00	LSB
Mar-24-14	letter to clerk of court fax filing pre-trial order	0.10	6.50	PL1
	Draft letter to 19th JDC for defendants' portion of pre-trial order.	2.00	120.00	PL2
Mar-25-14	Email from Burns regarding pretrial inserts.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Totals	27.65	\$2,104.50	

DISBURSEMENTS

Mar-26-14	Fax Filing Fee - Pre-Trial Inserts	5.00
Mar-27-14	Postage - to COC filing LALB's Pre-trial Inserts (CM/RRR) (plus return envelope)	7.59
	Totals	\$12.59

Total Fee & Disbursements

Previous Balance
Previous Payments

Balance Now Due

\$2,117.09

1,905.15

1,905.15

\$2,117.09

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

Invoice #: 9591

Page 3

April 11, 2014

PAYMENT DETAILS

Mar-12-14 For Services Rendered

1,905.15

Total Payments

1,905.15
\$1,905.15

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway

Suite A

Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

May 2, 2014

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

File #: 1107-0002

Inv #: 9630

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

RE: Robert Burns v. LA Auctioneering Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Apr-02-14	prepare [REDACTED] for trial	0.30	19.50	PL1
Apr-03-14	Telephone call from Judge's office; e-mail [REDACTED]	0.20	30.00	LSB
Apr-08-14	Telephone call to Judge's office re:trial;e-mail to clients [REDACTED]	1.30	195.00	LSB
	Preparation for trial; [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	2.50	375.00	LSB
Apr-09-14	Parking -Trial		10.00	LSB
	Trial; assign task to associate to prepare judgment	4.25	637.50	LSB
Apr-10-14	Review of prayer and prepared judgment.	0.70	87.50	JHL
	Revised judgment.	0.20	25.00	JHL
	Email to Burns regarding judgment.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Email from Burns regarding judgment.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Apr-11-14	Email from Burns regarding changes to Judgment.	0.20	25.00	JHL

Invoice #: 9630

Page 2

May 2, 2014

	Email to Burns regarding proposed judgment.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Receipt and review of judgment and letter submitted by Burns.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Apr-14-14	Review of Judgment	0.20	30.00	LSB
	Review of letter and proposed judgment by Burns	0.20	30.00	LSB
Apr-15-14	Letter to Court regarding Judgment.	0.20	25.00	JHL
	Letter to the Clerk of Court filing Judgment of Trial	0.10	6.00	PL2
Apr-23-14	Draft [REDACTED]	2.50	150.00	PL2
Apr-24-14	Receipt and review of letter from Burns requesting written reasons.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Apr-25-14	Received and review of letter and proposed written reason; assign to associate; Review of draft letter	0.40	60.00	LSB
	Prepared letter to judge fields regarding written reasons.	0.40	50.00	JHL
	Email to [REDACTED]	0.30	37.50	JHL
Apr-30-14	Receipt and review of email from Burns on written reasons	0.20	30.00	LSB
	Receipt and review of letter from Burns to Judge Fields regarding written reasons.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Totals	14.75	\$1,898.00	

DISBURSEMENTS

Apr-01-14	Photocopies - 306 BW @ \$0.10 each	30.60
Apr-15-14	Postage : Letter to Clerk of Court filing Judgment	2.98
	Deposition Costs - Court Reporter Transcript	195.00
	Totals	\$228.58

Invoice #: 9630

Page 3

May 2, 2014

Total Fee & Disbursements
Previous Balance

\$2,126.58
2,117.09

Balance Now Due

\$4,243.67

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.
 8708 Jefferson Highway
 Suite A
 Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
 11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
 Suite C
 Baton Rouge, LA
 70816

June 2, 2014

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0002
 Inv #: 9742

RE: Robert Burns v. LA Auctioneering Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
May-06-14	Letter to Clerk transmitting court costs	0.25	37.50	LSB
	Letter to Clerk of Court pending check for court cost	0.10	6.00	PL2
May-16-14	Receipt and review of judgment and letter to Board members	0.50	75.00	LSB
	Totals	0.85	<u>\$118.50</u>	

DISBURSEMENTS

	Photocopies	1.80
May-06-14	Postage Check to COC for court cost	0.48
May-19-14	Postage to client enclosed signed judgment	3.45
	Totals	<u>\$5.73</u>

Total Fee & Disbursements

	<u>\$124.23</u>
Previous Balance	4,243.67
Previous Payments	4,243.67
Balance Now Due	<u>\$124.23</u>

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

Invoice #: 9742

Page 2

June 2, 2014

PAYMENT DETAILS

May-06-14		2,117.09
May-14-14	Attorney Fees/expenses	2,126.58
	Total Payments	<hr/> \$4,243.67

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway
Suite A
Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

July 1, 2014

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0002

Inv #: 9877

RE: Robert Burns v. LA Auctioneering Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Jun-19-14	Receipt and review of motion and order for appeal.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Jun-20-14	Receipt and review of notice of appeal; assign task to Associate; copy to clients	0.25	37.50	LSB
Jun-23-14	Review and revised [REDACTED]	0.75	112.50	LSB
	Legal research regarding [REDACTED]	0.50	62.50	JHL
	Prepared [REDACTED]	1.20	150.00	JHL
	Review of pleadings on court connect.	0.30	37.50	JHL
	Email correspondence with Vivian regarding service.	0.20	25.00	JHL
Jun-24-14	Receipt and review of filings from Vivian.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Totals	3.40	\$450.00	
	Total Fee & Disbursements			\$450.00

Invoice #: 9877

Page 2

July 1, 2014

Retainers Applied

407.17

Previous Balance

124.23

Previous Payments

124.23

Balance Now Due

\$42.83

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

Jun-11-14

Attorney Fees/expenses

531.40

Total Payments

\$531.40

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway
Suite A
Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

August 5, 2014

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0002

Inv #: 9969

RE: Robert Burns v. LA Auctioneering Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Jul-07-14	Review of [REDACTED]	0.20	25.00	JHL
Jul-31-14	Review of [REDACTED]	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Totals	0.30	\$37.50	
	Total Fee & Disbursements			\$37.50
	Previous Balance			42.83
	Previous Payments			42.83
	Balance Now Due			\$37.50

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

Jul-09-14	Attorney Fees/expenses	42.83
	Total Payments	\$42.83

000004

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway
Suite A
Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

10-02-14

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0002
Inv #: 10062

RE: Robert Burns v. LA Auctioneering Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
08-11-14	Email from First Circuit.	0.10	12.50	JHL
08-13-14	Receipt and review of [REDACTED]	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Research regarding [REDACTED]	0.10	12.50	JHL
08-14-14	letter to court of appeals requesting oral arguments	0.10	6.50	LA
09-02-14	Email from Vivian regarding extension.	0.10	12.50	JHL
09-03-14	Phone call from Vivian regarding extension.	0.20	25.00	JHL
09-04-14	Receipt and review of [REDACTED]	0.10	12.50	JHL
09-18-14	Receipt and review of [REDACTED]	0.75	112.50	LSB
09-19-14	Receipt and review of [REDACTED]	1.00	125.00	JHL
	Discussed legal issues with LSB.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Phone call to clerk's office regarding record.	0.10	12.50	JHL

000020

Invoice #: 10062

Page 2

October 2, 2014

	Prepared letter to the First Circuit regarding intent to file opposition.	0.20	25.00	JHL
	Ordered Record from the First Circuit.	0.10	12.50	JHL
09-22-14	Review of [REDACTED]	0.50	75.00	LSB
	Review of [REDACTED]	0.30	37.50	JHL
	Legal research [REDACTED]	1.00	125.00	JHL
	Began preparing [REDACTED]	2.60	325.00	JHL
	Legal research regarding [REDACTED]	0.40	50.00	JHL
09-30-14	Review of [REDACTED] with Associate [REDACTED]	1.00	150.00	LSB
	Receipt and review of [REDACTED]	1.50	187.50	JHL
	Legal research [REDACTED]	0.70	87.50	JHL
	Preparation of [REDACTED]	2.70	337.50	JHL
	Totals	13.75	\$1,769.00	

DISBURSEMENTS

09-19-14	Credit Card Expense- Louisiana Court of Appeal, First Circuit	5.00	
09-22-14	Postage Expense - Letter to Court of Appeal regarding filing Opposition	0.48	
	Totals		\$5.48
	Total Fee & Disbursements		\$1,774.48
	Previous Balance		37.50
	Previous Payments		37.50
	Balance Now Due		\$1,774.48

000021

Invoice #: 10062

Page 3

October 2, 2014

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

Aug-26-14 Attorney Fees/expenses

37.50

Total Payments

37.50
\$37.50

000022

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway
Suite A
Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

11 -03-14

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0002

Inv #: 10143

RE: Robert Burns v. LA Auctioneering Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
10-01-14	Review and revised brief	1.25	187.50	LSB
	Prepared table of contents and table of authorities for first circuit brief.	0.80	100.00	JHL
	Revised first circuit brief.	0.50	62.50	JHL
	Email to Sandy and Tessa [REDACTED]	0.10	12.50	JHL
10-08-14	Final review of brief to first circuit court	0.75	112.50	LSB
	Added record citations to First Circuit brief.	0.60	75.00	JHL
10-10-14	Call to Court of Appeals regarding brief deadline	0.10	6.50	LA
	Draft Motion to Reinstate Oral Arguments	0.50	32.50	LA
	E-file Brief and Motion to Reinstate Oral Arguments with First Circuit Court of Appeals	0.20	13.00	LA
10-30-14	Receipt and review of signed order from First Circuit regarding oral argument.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Totals	4.90	\$614.50	

Invoice #: 10143

Page 2

November 3, 2014

DISBURSEMENTS

09-23-14 Credit Card Expense - Court Records 5.00
10-31-14 coping cost - 136x.10 13.60

Totals

\$18.60

Total Fee & Disbursements

\$633.10

Previous Balance

1,774.48

Previous Payments

1,774.48

Balance Now Due

\$633.10

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

Oct-15-14 Attorney Fees/expenses

1,774.48

Total Payments

\$1,774.48

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway
Suite A
Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

01 -06-15

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0004

Inv #: 10312

RE: Robert Burns, et al v LALB

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
12-03-14	Receipt and review of correspondence from Burns to Judge Hernandez.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Totals	0.10	\$12.50	
	Total Fee & Disbursements			<u>\$12.50</u>
	Previous Balance			237.50
	Previous Payments			237.50
	Balance Now Due			<u>\$12.50</u>

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

Oct-15-14	Attorney Fees/expenses			237.50
	Total Payments			<u>\$237.50</u>